

UPSET SALE

THURSDAY SEPTEMBER 21, 2023

LUZERNE COUNTY TAX CLAIM SALES TAX CLAIM BUREAU TAX SALES NOTICE

TO ALL OWNERS* OF PROPERTY DESCRIBED IN THIS NOTICE AND ALL PERSONS HAVING LIENS, TAX JUDGMENTS OR MUNICIPAL CLAIMS AGAINST SUCH PROPERTIES:

NOTICE is hereby given by ELITE REVENUE SOLUTIONS, LLC, as agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau, in and for the COUNTY OF LUZERNE under Sections 601-609 inclusive of the Real Estate Tax Law of 1947, as amended, that the Bureau will expose at public sale at the King's College Scandlon Physical Education Center, 150 N. Main Street, Wilkes-Barre, Pennsylvania, at 10:00 A.M., on September 21, 2023 or any date to which the sale may be adjourned, readjusted or continued, for the purpose of collecting unpaid 2021 and any PRIOR REAL ESTATE TAXES, PRIOR LIENS, MUNICIPAL CLAIMS, and all costs hereto, the following described set forth. Please make reference to the Tax Parcel Number and Property Identification Number with all correspondence.

The sale of this property may, AT THE OPTION OF THE BUREAU, be stayed if the owner thereof or any lien creditor of the OWNER, before the date of the sale, enters into an agreement with the BUREAU to pay the TAXES, Claims and Costs in installments in the manner provided by said Act, and the agreement to be entered into. The Bureau is prohibited from entering into a new installment agreement to stay sale within three (3) years of any default on an agreement to stay sale. (Section 603).

These Taxes and Costs can be paid up to the time of the sale.

THERE WILL BE NO REDEMPTION PERIOD AFTER THE DATE OF THE SALE.

IT IS STRONGLY URGED that prospective purchasers have an examination made of the title to any property in which they may be interested. Every effort has been made to keep the proceedings free from error. However, in every case the TAX CLAIM BUREAU is selling the TAXABLE INTEREST and the property is offered for sale by the TAX CLAIM BUREAU without any guarantee or warranty whatever, either as to structure or lack of structure upon the land, the liens, title or any other matter or thing whatever. Elite Revenue, in accordance with the statute, made diligent and reasonable efforts to provide notice to the record owner. Lien holders were not notified and all properties are being sold subject to any existing liens.

It is repeated that there is no redemption after the property is sold and all sales will be final. No adjustments will be made after the property is struck down.

THE PROPERTY MAY BE REDEEMED from the Tax Sale by paying the delinquent taxes, fees, interest penalties and costs prior to the day of the public auction. The payments must be cash, cashiers check, money order or certified check. The right to redeem the property expires on September 21, 2023 at 10:00 a.m.

THERE IS NO RIGHT OF REDEMPTION ON THE DAY OF OR AFTER THE PUBLIC AUCTION. If no payment has been received prior to the time of the sale, the property will be sold on September 21, 2023 at 10:00 a.m.

Pursuant to 68 P.S. 2117(c)(3), properties may be subject to a trump bid by North East Pennsylvania Land Bank Authority, or Lower South Valley Land Bank or City of Hazleton Land Bank prior to public auction. These municipalities subject to the Land Bank's in accordance with 68 P.S. (c)(3) are: Ashley Borough, Avoca Borough, City of Hazleton, City of Nanticoke, City of Wilkes Barre, Dupont Borough, Duryea Borough, Exeter Borough,

Hanover Township, Jenkins Township, Municipality of Kingston, Newport Township, Pittston City, Pittston Township, Plains Township, West Pittston Borough.

Prospective purchasers at all tax sales are required to certify as follows:

1. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County**, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying real estate taxes owed to taxing bodies within Luzerne County; and
2. In accordance with Section 619a of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.619a, a successful bidder shall be required to provide certification to the Bureau that such person is not delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County, nor is the bidder acting on behalf of another individual or entity who is delinquent in paying municipal utility bills owed to municipalities within Luzerne County.
3. Prospective bidders must register prior to sale. **DUE TO NEW LEGISLATION PASSED ON JUNE 25, 2021 AND EFFECTIVE AUGUST 29, 2021, IN THE STATE OF PENNSYLVANIA, REGISTRATION MUST BE COMPLETED IN PERSON AND NO LESS THAN TEN DAYS PRIOR TO EACH TAX SALE. THEREFORE, ALL REGISTRATION MUST BE COMPLETED WITH THE BUREAU NO LATER THAN 4:00 PM ON SEPTEMBER 8, 2023.**
4. A successful bidder shall not tender a bad certified check or money order to the Tax Claim Bureau when purchasing property in the sale. If this should occur that bidder shall not be permitted to bid on any properties in future sales and will be referred to the Luzerne County District Attorney's Office for prosecution under Pennsylvania Crimes Code, 18 Pa. C.S.A §4105 which may lead to a CONVICTION OF A FELONY OF THE THIRD DEGREE.
5. Pursuant to Section 601 (d) of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law, 72 P.S. § 5860.601 (d), prospective bidders must certify that they have not had a landlord license revoked in any municipality in Luzerne County and that they are not acting as an agent for a person whose landlord license has been revoked.

PAYMENT BY THE SUCCESSFUL BIDDER IS DUE THE DAY OF SALE AND SHALL BE MADE IN THE FORM OF CASH, CERTIFIED CHECK, OR MONEY ORDER. In the event that a successful bidder does not tender payment in full for any bid by 4:00 p.m. on September 21, 2023, the bid will be nullified and the bidder will not be permitted to bid at future tax sales conducted by the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau.

Certification forms are available in the Tax Claim Bureau or on-line at www.luzernecountytaxclaim.com. Click on Upset Sale and bidder's certification.

IMPORTANT: Right to surplus sale proceeds. If the property is not redeemed from public sale and you are the record owner, then you are entitled to sale proceeds which exceed taxes, interest, penalties, costs, Commonwealth Liens, Municipal Liens, Government Liens and Judgment Liens.

Interest accrues at the rate of 9% per year, at ¾% each month effective February 1, of each year.

The County of Luzerne does not discriminate on the basis of race, color, national origin, sex, religion, age, disability, or familial status in employment or the provision of services.

The Scandlon Physical Education Center is a facility accessible to persons with disabilities. Please notify this Tax Claim Bureau if special accommodations are required. The Tax Claim Bureau can be contacted at (570) 825-1512 or by fax at (570) 820-6339, or by TDD (570) 825-1860.

IF YOU HAVE ANY QUESTIONS AS TO WHAT YOU MUST DO PLEASE CONTACT THE TAX CLAIM BUREAU AT (570) 825-1512.

Elite Revenue Solutions, LLC
Agent for the Luzerne County Tax Claim Bureau
Sean P. Shamany, Director

* "Owner," the person in whose name the property is last registered, if registered according to law, or, if not registered according to law, the person whose name last appears as an owner of record on any deed

or instrument of conveyance recorded in the county office designated for recording, and in all other cases means any person in open, peaceable and notorious possession of the property, as apparent owner or owners thereof, or the reputed owner or owners thereof, in the neighborhood of such property.

** The successful bidder is also certifying that they are not the owner of the property, as the owner has no right to purchase his own property pursuant to Section 618 of the Real Estate Tax Sale Law. A change of name or business status shall not defeat the purpose of this section. For the purpose of this section, "owner" means any individual, partner, shareholder, trust, partnership, limited partnership, corporation or any other business association or any trust, partnership, limited partnership, corporation or any other business association that has any individual as part of the business association who had any ownership interest or rights in the property.

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
1	Sale #	Municipality	Parcel	Owner	Property Description	Upset Price	Results	Bidder #
3	23-0035	ASHLEY BORO WARD 3	01-J9NE4 -002-017-000	HUNTER JEREMY &	66 FALL ST	\$8,290.67	SOLD - \$38,000	152
4	23-0038	AVOCA BORO WARD 1	02-D125E4-022-008-000	REYNOLDS MICHAEL	706 MCALPINE ST	\$10,917.72	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
5	23-0047	AVOCA BORO WARD 3	02-D12NE4-001-003-000	KIBUBI LOUIE	YORK AVE	\$2,955.62	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
6	23-0048	AVOCA BORO WARD 3	02-D12NE4-001-004-000	KIBUBI LOUIE	YORK AVE	\$2,955.62	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
7	23-0102	BEAR CREEK TWP	04-J11S1 -002-018-000	CHISMAR STEPHEN & MARY	527 ADJ WOODLAND RD	\$1,444.27	NO BID	
8	23-0120	BEAR CREEK TWP	04-K13S1 -007-008-000	HARKINS JAMES & SHARON MARIE	BEAR CREEK BLVD	\$8,054.95	SOLD - \$8,054.95	115
9	23-0087	BEAR CREEK TWP	04-H12 -00A-05N-000	K D LAND LLC & CHILCOTE STEPHEN A	BALD MOUNTAIN RD	\$65,655.88	NO BID	
10	23-0118	BEAR CREEK TWP	04-K13S1 -005-009-000	KNECHT VINCE E ETAL	BEAR CREEK BLVD	\$2,557.45	NO BID	
11	23-0119	BEAR CREEK TWP	04-K13S1 -005-011-000	KNECHT VINCENT E	BEAR CREEK BLVD	\$1,906.85	NO BID	
12	23-0093	BEAR CREEK TWP	04-11S1 -004-28B-000	MOSLEY GERALD & BARBARA	MOSLEY LN	\$10,076.54	SOLD - \$10,076.54	1
13	23-0082	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S2 -005-027-000	55 GENERAL GREEN LLC	41 LAKE VALLEY DR	\$4,226.93	NO BID	
14	23-0079	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S1 -006-013-000	BONIFACIO ZELPHA P	IROQUOIS CIR	\$3,759.39	NO BID	
15	23-0084	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S6 -001-039-000	BRUNDAGE RONALD E & ANDREA L	TURNBERRY LN	\$11,424.13	NO BID	
16	23-0062	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-T3 -00A-05G-000	HARKER WALTER E	2024 TOMHICKEN RD	\$5,247.27	SOLD - \$5,247.27	69
17	23-0060	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-S3 -00A-10G-000	HART GEORGE E	MAIN ST	\$5,759.87	SOLD - \$5,759.87	21
18	23-0078	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S1 -002-019-000	KOSANAM HARI &	30 HURON CIR	\$3,493.79	NO BID	
19	23-0075	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U4S4 -001-08A-000	REINHART JACK WILSON SR & ANGELA	10 STAUFFER AVE	\$11,557.49	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
20	23-0077	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-U5S1 -001-005-000	SORIANO FE M & MANUEL M	2 HURON CIR	\$3,465.16	NO BID	
21	23-0064	BLACK CREEK TWP	03-T3S1 -002-008-000	WEITZEL THERESA P	PARK ST	\$4,893.39	SOLD - \$4,893.39	24
22	23-0129	BUCK TWP	05-K14S1 -002-010-000	WHITEMEN PAUL	MARGURUM LN	\$1,703.31	NO BID	
23	23-0153	BUTLER TWP WARD 1	06-Q8S3 -001-10N-000	EUBANKS ROBERT	43 JAMES LN	\$4,388.40	NO BID	
24	23-0151	BUTLER TWP WARD 1	06-Q8S3 -001-10I-000	PANAS OLGA	41 JAMES LN	\$1,908.31	NO BID	
25	23-0155	BUTLER TWP WARD 1	06-Q8S3 -001-18B-000	PANAS OLGA	JAMES LN	\$1,568.10	NO BID	
26	23-0150	BUTLER TWP WARD 1	06-Q8S2 -001-08A-000	STEPHANIE ALMEIDA PROPERTIES LLC	67 W BUTLER DR	\$7,621.89	SOLD - \$7,621.89	489
27	23-0166	BUTLER TWP WARD 1	06-R8S1 -019-004-000	TEDESCO FRANK JOHN AND MARILYN L		\$5,165.41	NO BID	
28	23-0169	BUTLER TWP WARD 2	06-Q8S11 -004-012-000	BORIS OLIVERY CASTRO MAJANO &	DEBBIE DR	\$1,943.47	NO BID	
29	23-0172	BUTLER TWP WARD 2	06-Q8S9 -003-006-000	BORIS OLIVERY CASTRO MAJARO &	MINK SPRINGS CT	\$2,040.19	NO BID	
30	23-0170	BUTLER TWP WARD 2	06-Q8S11 -004-013-000	KOTCH JOHN W & BONNIE A	164 DEBBIE DR	\$2,020.81	NO BID	
31	23-0201	CONYNGHAM TWP	09-M5S1 -001-005-000	STRZALKA STANLEY ETAL	LILY AVE	\$2,205.44	NO BID	
32	23-0185	COURTDALE BORO	07-G9S1 -009-008-000	UREVITCH JOSEPH	252 COURTDALE AVE	\$6,958.90	NO BID	
33	23-0253	DALLAS TWP	10-E8S2 -007-005-000	CAMPBELL LESTER E & CECILIA J	1089 LOWER DEMUNDS RD	\$10,326.60	SOLD - \$21,000	69
34	23-0217	DALLAS TWP	10-C7S3 -009-008-000	COMISKEY BERNARD	WARREN AVE	\$1,360.47	NO BID	
35	23-0252	DALLAS TWP	10-E8S2 -006-001-000	DAVIS THOMAS L + HANNAH	BROOK ST	\$624.40	NO BID	
36	23-0216	DALLAS TWP	10-C7S3 -008-006-000	JUBIS SOPHIA	HIGGS AVE	\$11,897.43	NO BID	
37	23-0243	DALLAS TWP	10-D8S4A -006-002-000	MILLER ROBERT JR & ISABEL	2 WASHINGTON ST	\$12,884.92	SOLD - \$12,884.92	69
38	23-0228	DALLAS TWP	10-C9 -T02-107-000	MORAN JANELLE LYNN	107 VALLEY VIEW TRAILER PARK	\$872.59	NO BID	
39	23-0259	DALLAS TWP	10-E8S3 -006-011-000	PRENONE JOSEPH W & FLORENCE	OVERBROOK RD	\$2,683.50	SOLD - \$4,000	69
40	23-0258	DALLAS TWP	10-E8S3 -006-010-000	PRENONE JOSEPH W + FLORENCE	233 OVERBROOK RD	\$9,437.65	SOLD - \$50,000	69
41	23-0214	DALLAS TWP	10-C7 -T01-031-000	SANZALONE ANGELA	31 COUNTRY PINE EST	\$808.46	SOLD - \$808.46	37
42	23-0247	DALLAS TWP	10-E8S1 -012-007-000	SUSQUEHANNA INVESTORS LIMITED	POPLAR ST	\$1,123.93	NO BID	
43	23-0250	DALLAS TWP	10-E8S1 -VAR-VAR-001	SUSQUEHANNA INVESTORS LTD	COUNTY RD	\$5,627.86	SOLD - \$5,627.86	117
44	23-0283	DENNISON TWP	13-N10S2 -002-004-000	SCHERTZINGER THELMA D & TANA D	E NESCOPECK LN	\$2,326.27	SOLD - \$27,000	245
45	23-0287	DENNISON TWP	13-O12S2 -T01-017-000	WILLIAMS JOHN & TERRY	17 BEECH CREST LN	\$532.29	NO BID	
46	23-0337	DUPONT BORO	15-E12NE4-006-030-000	POPLAWSKI EDMUND R & KALASINSKI KIM	228 MAIN ST	\$14,273.00	SOLD - \$14,273.00	210
47	23-0335	DUPONT BORO	15-E12NE4-002-010-000	WARUNEK EDWARD J & KENNETH	COOLIDGE ST	\$1,718.35	NO BID	
48	23-0291	DURYEA BORO WARD 1	14-D11S1 -002-11A-000	SHIELDS JOYCE	838 COXTON RD	\$2,071.61	SOLD - \$2,071.61	286
49	23-0326	DURYEA BORO WARD 5	14-D12NE3-006-006-000	WARD CATHERINE	810 LYNN ST	\$7,769.87	SOLD - \$18,000	69
50	23-0431	EDWARDSVILLE WARD 1	18-G9S3 -005-10A-000	GARNETT CHARLES	133 ZERBY AVE	\$8,646.13	SOLD - \$32,000	69
51	23-0440	EDWARDSVILLE WARD 3	18-G9S2 -012-028-000	JANCEWICZ THADDEUS T & MARY K	15 HILLSIDE AVE	\$8,612.51	SOLD - \$24,000	69
52	23-0441	EDWARDSVILLE WARD 3	18-G9S2 -012-056-000	PETRO MARY LOU & EDWARD	31 R HILLSIDE AVE	\$9,317.64	SOLD - \$18,500	69
53	23-0457	EDWARDSVILLE WARD 7	18-G9S2 -015-025-000	KAUDAL INVESTMENT CORP	197 GREEN ST	\$2,868.78	NO BID	
54	23-0364	EXETER BORO WARD 3	16-E11S1-006-03A-000	JUMPER ESTHER	322 SUSQUEHANNA AVE	\$13,189.38	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
55	23-0367	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-D10 -T02-031-000	BESANCON MELISSA JEAN	31 MT LOOKOUT TRAILER CT	\$630.56	NO BID	
56	23-0397	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -T01-326-000	BIRCHWOOD MHC LLC	326 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$1,604.26	NO BID	
57	23-0391	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -T01-243-000	BURNEY LEE TERRI	243 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$2,123.47	NO BID	
58	23-0381	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-228	CARUTHERS SARAH ANN	233 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$1,368.46	NO BID	
59	23-0398	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -T01-329-000	DACRI JOSEPH & JULIE	329 BIRCHWOOD ESTATES	\$936.71	NO BID	
60	23-0394	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -T01-302-000	ELECTRIC CITY HOMES	302 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$750.88	NO BID	
61	23-0372	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-036	FALVO GERALD	224 FOURTH ST	\$1,988.43	NO BID	
62	23-0374	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-059	GOBLE ANN	280 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$1,007.57	NO BID	
63	23-0392	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -T01-259-000	GOBLE ANN Y &	259 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$747.81	NO BID	
64	23-0383	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-297	HEIL RAYMOND & DAUBERT DENISE	309 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$1,555.75	NO BID	
65	23-0393	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -T01-263-000	KUDRAKO JEROME	263 BIRCHWOOD ESTATES	\$795.04	NO BID	
66	23-0384	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-366	NICE DAVID	231 BIRCHWOOD ESTATES	\$2,507.09	NO BID	
67	23-0387	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -T01-134-000	PADOL NANCY	134 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$1,940.63	NO BID	
68	23-0373	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-047	PARKER SCOTT	229 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$1,250.45	NO BID	
69	23-0370	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-009	PRICE THOMAS	171 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$1,680.77	NO BID	
70	23-0379	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-015-178	ROY TIMOTHY	402 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$1,059.23	NO BID	
71	23-0399	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10S2 -000-VAR-000	RUCKNO GEO L INC	ANTHRACITE ST	\$7,761.51	NO BID	
72	23-0402	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10S2 -006-001-000	RUCKNO INC GEORGE L	WASHINGTON ST	\$15,147.27	NO BID	
73	23-0369	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-D10 -T02-090-000	WIN BRIAN J	90 MT LOOKOUT TRAILER CT	\$1,388.55	NO BID	
74	23-0386	EXETER BORO WARD 4	16-E10 -00A-12A-067	ZUPANCIC WILLIAM J JR & JOYCE	250 BIRCHWOOD EST	\$985.33	NO BID	
75	23-0419	EXETER TWP	17-B10S3 -001-02V-000	HECK JOYCE REDMOND	SUTTON CREEK RD	\$7,298.89	SOLD - \$24,000	69
76	23-0420	EXETER TWP	17-B11S2 -001-030-000	LYNOTT ELIZABETH	SULLIVAN TRL	\$11,487.61	NO BID	
77	23-0418	EXETER TWP	17-B10S1 -010-002-000	MCNULTY RAYMOND W & JENNIFER	RHOLAND RD/PAPER RD	\$1,784.85	NO BID	
78	23-0460	FAIRMOUNT TWP	19-F2 -00A-17A-000	OHARA WALTER C & TAMRE L	694 STATE ROUTE 118	\$5,912.90	NO BID	
79	23-0478	FAIRVIEW TWP	20-K10S3 -002-004-000	HILENSKI LAWRENCE & BARBARA	19 CHESTNUT ST	\$15,285.18	NO BID	
80	23-0497	FORTY FORT BORO WARD 3	21-F10NW3-001-017-000	CROSSMON DAVID C	1854 MURRAY ST	\$12,142.85	SOLD - \$86,000	308
81	23-0498	FORTY FORT BORO WARD 3	21-F10S1-005-006-000	SMITH JAMES N & DAVID J	1603 WYOMING AVE	\$14,330.26	SOLD - \$39,000	69
82	23-0555	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S1 -009-010-000	BESTRESKI SCOTT A	BROOKSIDE DR	\$1,244.47	NO BID	
83	23-0578	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S8 -011-004-000	CAMPBELL MATTHEW	20 GAIL DR	\$10,736.80	SOLD - \$10,736.80	245
84	23-0567	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S6 -014-016-000	CROGAN CAROL E	HOLIDAY DR	\$1,690.54	NO BID	
85	23-0556	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S1 -010-009-000	GREGORY JOHN R & LORETTA	12 FOX RUN DR	\$3,870.87	SOLD - \$3,870.87	245
86	23-0577	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S8 -009-016-000	IOVINO WILLIAM & LINDA	PRESCOTT RD	\$1,244.47	SOLD - \$1,244.47	310
87	23-0596	FOSTER TWP	23-R9NE1 -008-003-000	KUZMA ANDREW ETAL	524 GREEN ST	\$4,551.68	SOLD - \$42,000	82
88	23-0568	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S6 -015-005-000	LISZKA MARK & EWELINA	WOODHAVEN DR	\$1,138.96	NO BID	
89	23-0579	FOSTER TWP	23-Q12 -00A-011-014	LOUGHERY PATRICK M	14 LADNERS ACRES	\$704.67	NO BID	
90	23-0572	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S8 -003-008-000	MARSHALL ALAN	PRESCOTT RD	\$1,244.47	NO BID	
91	23-0565	FOSTER TWP	23-Q11S6 -008-011-000	MJB OF BAYSHORE LLC	WOODHAVEN DR	\$1,244.47	SOLD - \$1,244.47	310
92	23-0594	FOSTER TWP	23-R11S1 -001-009-000	PIETRZYK EMILIA	POLONIA CT	\$5,002.06	SOLD - \$5,002.06	245

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
93	23-0554	FOSTER TWP	23-Q1151-008-020-000	STRUBECK SONIA C	INDIAN DR	\$1,158.96	SOLD - \$1,158.96	310
94	23-0570	FOSTER TWP	23-Q1157-007-006-000	TOWNSEND MARK T	HOLIDAY DR	\$1,690.54	NO BID	
95	23-0607	FRANKLIN TWP	24-B9 -00A-07N-000	SCHOOLEY ADAM & JUSINE T	26200	\$3,721.92	NO BID	
96	23-0507	FREELAND BORO WARD 1	22-R9NE2-012-04B-000	PGA INCORPORATED	ADJ PUBLIC RD	\$31,055.05	NO BID	
97	23-0511	FREELAND BORO WARD 2	22-Q9SE3-009-08A-000	BEAM RONALD	103 OAK ST	\$7,975.75	SOLD - \$34,000	245
98	23-0528	FREELAND BORO WARD 3	22-Q9SE4-T01-022-000	COPELAND DAVID J &	22 807 SCHWABE ST	\$1,493.59	BIDDER FORFEIT - OFF TO JUDICIAL	
99	23-0527	FREELAND BORO WARD 3	22-Q9SE4-T01-014-000	KOCKIE ROBERT	14 HAWK HILLS CT	\$1,218.78	NO BID	
100	23-0547	FREELAND BORO WARD 6	22-R9NE2-017-008-000	LEBRON STEVEN	442 CENTER ST	\$15,297.06	SOLD - \$46,000	69
101	23-0637	HANOVER TWP WARD 2	25-I9SE1-014-028-000	JOHNSON GERTRUDE	24 COLUMBIA AVE	\$6,680.90	SOLD - \$21,000	319
102	23-0654	HANOVER TWP WARD 4	25-19NW2-005-021-000	MORENA ESCUTIA VALENTIN	4 LUZERNE ST	\$7,755.66	NO BID	
103	23-0682	HANOVER TWP WARD 5	25-19NW4-12A-04A-000	SHAFFER STANLEY R JR	SAN SOUCI PKWY	\$1,097.09	SOLD - \$1,097.09	314
104	23-0674	HANOVER TWP WARD 5	25-18S2-009-011-000	THOMAS WAYNE	41 RUTTER ST	\$1,929.76	NO BID	
105	23-0665	HANOVER TWP WARD 5	25-18NE2-007-040-000	WDOOWIAK NELLIE	565 SHAWNEE ST	\$9,669.66	SOLD - \$45,000	69
106	23-0694	HANOVER TWP WARD 6	25-J8S2-001-013-000	EVANS NELSON & MARGARET	2622 S MAIN ST	\$8,190.27	SOLD - \$8,190.27	69
107	23-0702	HANOVER TWP WARD 6	25-J8S2A-002-011-000	SOLOMON JOSEPH & DEBORAH	40 TANYA DR	\$20,632.73	SOLD - \$33,000	291
108	23-0695	HANOVER TWP WARD 6	25-J8S2-004-006-000	TIPPINS DEBORA A & BERRY RAY L JR	HARRISON ST	\$2,151.88	NO BID	
109	23-0708	HANOVER TWP WARD 7	25-18NE2-019-020-000	MESH THADDEWUS & BERNADINE	317 LYNWOOD AVE	\$19,081.17	BIDDER FORFEIT - OFF TO JUDICIAL	
110	23-2816	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-C6S1-001-10A-000	EBBECKE FREDERICK	KITCHEN AVE	\$909.01	NO BID	
111	23-2817	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-C6S1-001-10B-000	EBBECKE FREDERICK	KITCHEN AVE	\$909.01	NO BID	
112	23-2832	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-C6S7-001-005-078	FRANTZ TIMOTHY JAMES	416 SMITH ST	\$1,553.59	NO BID	
113	23-2833	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-C6S7-001-005-112	GALLAGHER DESIREE TARISE	307 LARK LN	\$801.28	NO BID	
114	23-2834	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-C6S7-002-019-000	PUTERBAUGH MABEL E ESTATE	GROVE ST	\$765.99	NO BID	
115	23-2831	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-C6S7-001-005-029	ROBINSON TERRY	206 EAGLE LN	\$2,130.42	NO BID	
116	23-2824	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-C6S11-001-003-000	SGARLAT CAROL	SGARLAT AVE	\$3,297.90	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
117	23-2826	HARVEYS LAKE BORO	74-C6S11-001-025-000	SGARLAT CAROL	SGARLAT AVE	\$21,494.47	SOLD - \$21,494.47	68
118	23-0728	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-S7 -T02-002-000	ARISMENDY SANTANA	310 HOLLY LYNN DR	\$2,944.50	NO BID	
119	23-0745	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-S8S6-009-010-000	GENEROSE MARY JOSEPHINE	57 MAIN ST	\$5,943.24	BIDDER FORFEIT - OFF TO JUDICIAL	
120	23-0729	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-S7 -T02-018-000	MANZUETA MARIE	147 HOLLY LYNN DR	\$2,267.91	NO BID	
121	23-0761	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-U5S2-006-006-000	NAVARRA ARLEEN V	LAKE VALLEY DR	\$2,918.52	NO BID	
122	23-0737	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-S8S2-002-009-000	THOMAS ELAINE MARY	HARLEIGH BLVD	\$4,540.86	SOLD - \$4,540.86	175
123	23-0734	HAZLE TWP WARD 1	26-S7S2-001-08E-000	YANAC AMANDA L	RR 4 BOX 4024	\$9,580.25	SOLD - \$27,000	383
124	23-0835	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13-001-262-000	ABESAMIS JOHN AUGUST RAMO & JOANNE	BUTTERNUT LN	\$4,122.44	NO BID	
125	23-0821	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10-012-419-000	ADAMS MATTHEW C & CORIE	LAUREL VLY	\$3,065.59	NO BID	
126	23-0842	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14-001-028-000	AMIL SYLBERT	WHITE OAK LN	\$4,074.72	NO BID	
127	23-0828	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S12-001-155-000	BAMIDELE GBOLAHAN	BUTTONBUSH LN	\$6,031.02	NO BID	
128	23-0897	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S7-010-015-000	BILINSKI EMIL A JR	234 CROW ST	\$3,692.77	NO BID	
129	23-0829	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S12-001-176-000	BITOR RODOLFO AND ELIZABETH	SPICE BUSH DR	\$4,156.98	NO BID	
130	23-0913	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U7 -T03-100-000	BLUMMER ALLEN	348 WESTGATE DR	\$1,686.76	BIDDER FORFEIT - OFF TO JUDICIAL	
131	23-0898	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S8-001-012-000	BRAIDO JOHN W	12 TURNBERRY LN	\$3,290.85	NO BID	
132	23-0899	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S8-001-013-000	BRAIDO JOHN W & BEVERLY A	481 TURNBERRY LN	\$25,359.24	SOLD - \$235,000	135
133	23-0817	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10-003-268-000	CAJULIS RAYMOND S & CORAZON B	LAUREL VALLEY DR	\$3,997.41	NO BID	
134	23-0896	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S7-010-004-000	CARINO LEO & MARITES	223 CHIPPEWA DR	\$2,060.18	NO BID	
135	23-0811	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10-001-020-000	CASTRO ABRAHAM AND NOEMI T	MOUNTAIN LAUREL DR	\$4,549.56	NO BID	
136	23-0810	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10-001-006-000	CHEN YAXIN	SILKY WILLOW DR	\$3,624.99	NO BID	
137	23-0844	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14-001-177-000	CRUZ DAMARYS A	MAPLE LN	\$3,816.03	NO BID	
138	23-0867	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15-001-539-000	DIAZ JOSE A AND ZINAB CHRISTINE	BLACK WALNUT DRIVE	\$4,647.54	NO BID	
139	23-0860	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15-001-317-000	DILAG ADRIA & LEOSANDRO	BLUE SPRUCE DR	\$3,641.82	NO BID	
140	23-0841	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14-001-027-000	DIZON JULIUS & KIM	WHITE OAK LN	\$3,461.94	NO BID	
141	23-0772	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1-001-188-000	ESGUERRA NOEL & JOSEPHINE	BROAD MT DRIVE	\$1,677.31	NO BID	
142	23-0874	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S2-009-007-000	FAJARDO PAUL ALLEN & ELLEN R	E CALUMET DR	\$3,327.94	NO BID	
143	23-0769	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1-001-114-000	FAJUTAGANA FRANK & CATHERINE V	HONG MT DR	\$1,026.90	NO BID	
144	23-0886	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S5-008-012-000	GARCIA RHODORA & WILLIAM	PINE VALLEY LN	\$3,845.54	NO BID	
145	23-0877	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S3-005-019-000	GIBALDI JOSEPH	MUSKOGON CIR	\$4,482.29	NO BID	
146	23-0859	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15-001-290-000	GONZALES GERALD B & KATHLEEN A YAP	CRANBERRY LN	\$4,102.44	NO BID	
147	23-0840	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13-001-390-000	HONG YOO JEONG	HONEYSUCKLE DR	\$4,506.27	NO BID	
148	23-0846	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14-001-185-000	IKIARA SOSPETER KARANI	HICKORY LN	\$4,100.44	NO BID	
149	23-0853	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14-001-408-000	JAVE LUIS A & YFREY Z	CASHAW DR	\$2,945.49	NO BID	
150	23-0778	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1-001-558-000	JIANG HONGXIN AND FENG YAPING	MOUNTAIN VIEW DR	\$5,324.56	NO BID	
151	23-0786	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2-001-308-000	KELLEHER ELIZABETH		\$3,796.84	NO BID	
152	23-0906	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S8-008-030-000	KELLER MARC J & KAREN G	UNAMI CIR	\$3,874.12	NO BID	
153	23-0826	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S12-001-026-000	LAMBUJON ALMA BONITA D	SPICE BUSH LN	\$3,728.31	NO BID	
154	23-0907	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S9-001-035-000	LAMPONG GEORINDA	TURNBERRY LN	\$5,659.59	NO BID	
155	23-0838	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13-001-372-000	LEDDY THOMAS	LOT 372 THE VISTAS	\$4,913.97	NO BID	
156	23-0839	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13-001-373-000	LEDDY THOMAS	LOT 373 THE VISTAS	\$4,722.98	NO BID	
157	23-0814	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S10-001-078-000	MANINGAS ARSENIA &	ELDERBERRY LN	\$5,162.15	NO BID	
158	23-0881	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S4-006-026-000	MARQUEZ VIRGO L & ANGELITO B	GREENBRIAR LN	\$3,061.74	NO BID	
159	23-0788	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2-001-381-000	MARTINEZ CASIANO Z & MARY LOREDEL		\$3,558.21	NO BID	
160	23-0887	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S5-010-008-000	MATIAS BENJAMIN & ANA	INVERNESS LN	\$3,338.62	NO BID	
161	23-0783	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2-001-176-000	MBURO GEORGE O		\$4,064.24	NO BID	
162	23-0863	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15-001-353-000	MCELWEE JOHN	HONEYSUCKLE DR	\$3,624.99	NO BID	
163	23-0864	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S15-001-369-000	MCELWEE JOHN	HONEYSUCKLE DR	\$3,624.99	NO BID	
164	23-0774	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1-001-363-000	MCELWEE JOHN & DONNA	NARROWLEAF	\$4,150.18	NO BID	
165	23-0833	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13-001-102-000	MCKEOWN JAMES AND STEPHANIE	MAPLE LN	\$4,598.90	NO BID	
166	23-0852	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14-001-367-000	MENDEVIL JENNIFER LEGASPI	VIRGINIA PINE & MAPLE LN	\$4,313.37	NO BID	
167	23-0871	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S2-007-008-000	MENDOZA PHILIP M & MARITONNE	SEMINOLE CIR	\$3,434.09	NO BID	
168	23-0762	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-S8S10A-010-001-000	MONTONE VINCENT	NORTHWEST CORNER	\$5,190.82	NO BID	
169	23-0795	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T7S1E1-001-008-000	MORANA ROBERT A & RICHARD J	198 FOREST LN	\$7,196.33	SOLD - \$16,500	308
170	23-0796	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T7S1E1-001-01A-000	MORANA ROBERT A & RICHARD J	198 FOREST LN	\$2,684.19	SOLD - \$2,684.19	308
171	23-0910	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U6S1-003-006-000	MOTOR FULTON	FRONT ST	\$4,603.84	NO BID	
172	23-0911	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U6S1-003-007-000	MOTOR FULTON	FRONT ST	\$4,768.82	NO BID	
173	23-0912	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U6S1-003-06A-000	MOTOR FULTON	BACK ST	\$3,447.50	NO BID	
174	23-0890	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S6-002-001-000	MROZOSKI JAMES M & DORISH KATHLEEN	398 EH TURNBERRY LN	\$5,676.05	NO BID	
175	23-0773	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1-001-349-000	MUIR JANICE G & JASON J	BLUE MOUNTAIN DR N	\$7,002.86	NO BID	
176	23-0808	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T9S1-001-011-000	MUNOZ ROA SAGRARIO A	ASHMORE RD	\$4,417.43	NO BID	
177	23-0876	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S3-005-007-000	NGUGI MARY & HENRY	MUSKOGON CIR	\$2,612.93	NO BID	
178	23-0780	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S1-001-665-000	NIU XINLI	MOUNTAINS VIEW DR	\$4,045.09	NO BID	
179	23-0832	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S13-001-082-000	OLARTE PHILMER & ELSA	HICKORY LANE	\$4,999.90	NO BID	
180	23-0883	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S4-010-023-000	OSTREA BRIGITTE LIENU L & JOAQUIN P	GLEN EAGLES DR	\$4,122.44	NO BID	
181	23-0849	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14-001-256-000	PANGANIBAN JOEL M	ALDEN LN	\$4,436.59	NO BID	
182	23-0782	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2-001-118-000	PATUBO CELIA ALCID AND NICOLAS DIAZ		\$3,393.85	NO BID	
183	23-0922	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-V7S2-002-06A-000	POON LUCILLA	215 BEAVER BROOK RD	\$1,030.56	NO BID	
184	23-0850	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5S14-001-260-000	RACRAQUIN LEONILA & ROMEO	ALDEN LN	\$4,092.88	NO BID	
185	23-0790	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T5S2-001-439-000	RAWLINS TERESITA & GUY		\$3,902.81	NO BID	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
186	23-0889	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U555 -012-009-000	RICO FERDINAND	TURNBERRY LN	\$1,726.97	NO BID	
187	23-0836	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5513 -001-263-000	ROCCA PATRICK L & ELIANE	BUTTERNUT LN	\$4,122.44	NO BID	
188	23-0856	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5515 -001-204-000	ROQUE HERMIE M & FEDERICO M	BUTTONBUSH LN	\$3,740.53	NO BID	
189	23-0847	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5514 -001-198-000	SABALLA MERLY	SASSAFRAS LN	\$4,102.44	NO BID	
190	23-0894	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U557 -007-001-000	SALAZAR SHERWIN & EUNICE	174 KICKAPOO DR	\$3,494.87	NO BID	
191	23-0816	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5510 -002-241-000	SARITA ALEJANDRO HIRALDO	LAUREL VALLEY RD	\$4,102.44	NO BID	
192	23-0779	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T551 -001-561-000	SUAREZ ESTRELLA S & ALEJANDRO M	MOUNTAIN VIEW DR	\$4,552.07	NO BID	
193	23-0785	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T552 -001-246-000	SY CESAR B & LETICIA C AND		\$3,512.19	NO BID	
194	23-0843	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5514 -001-113-000	TAMBA ALVIN & SHAH	BAYTREE CIRCLE	\$4,102.44	NO BID	
195	23-0787	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T552 -001-378-000	TAN CESAR AND MARIA		\$3,692.77	NO BID	
196	23-0825	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5512 -001-018-000	TORRALBA MALVIN MISAEAL	ELDERBERRY LN	\$4,818.52	NO BID	
197	23-0815	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5510 -001-122-000	TRINIDAD ALBERTO A AND ELIZABETH O	ELDERBERRY LN	\$5,569.60	NO BID	
198	23-0848	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U5514 -001-199-000	VO JONATHAN	SASSAFRAS LN	\$4,122.44	NO BID	
199	23-0905	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U558 -006-025-000	VULPE CORNELIU T & DANA	TURNBERRY LN	\$4,054.72	NO BID	
200	23-0776	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-T551 -001-391-000	WRIGHT MELVIN M JR AND MARIE E	HAWK MOUNTAIN DR	\$3,686.84	NO BID	
201	23-0902	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U558 -002-024-000	ZELANO INVESTMENTS	244 CORN SILK AVE	\$4,787.88	NO BID	
202	23-0914	HAZLE TWP WARD 2	26-U752 -002-011-000	ZILLER MICHAEL & MICHELLE	103 CRYSTAL RIDGE CT	\$3,122.96	SOLD - \$3,122.96	69
203	23-2082	HAZLETON CITY WARD 2	71-T85W34-020-01A-000	PERALTA RODALY	E JUNIPER ST	\$3,071.06	NO BID	
204	23-2096	HAZLETON CITY WARD 3	71-T85W34-015-11A-000	BERRY CYNTHIA TRUSTEE	332 E CHAPEL ST	\$5,272.07	SOLD - \$40,000	141
205	23-2120	HAZLETON CITY WARD 5	71-U8NW44-001-035-000	FELIZ SANTO POLANCO	35 DAVID RD	\$6,448.47	BIDDER FORFEIT - OFF TO JUDICIAL	
206	23-2134	HAZLETON CITY WARD 8	71-T85W13-011-002-000	SIMUTIO GAVRIL & GEORGE BOROS	353 W BROAD ST	\$22,600.09	SOLD - \$22,600.09	25
207	23-2170	HAZLETON CITY WARD 11	71-T8NW44-020-002-000	MIZENKO JEREMY & STEPHANIE	618 REAR JAMES ST	\$9,721.54	NO BID	
208	23-2187	HAZLETON CITY WARD 12	71-T7NE33-002-021-000	KOIS NICOLETTE (SERITSKY)	765 MCNAIR ST	\$6,805.69	SOLD - \$35,000	192
209	23-2188	HAZLETON CITY WARD 12	71-T7NE33-002-21A-000	KOIS NICOLETTE (SERITSKY)	767 MCNAIR ST	\$7,990.26	SOLD - \$21,000	114
210	23-2181	HAZLETON CITY WARD 12	71-T7NE22-003-005-000	SOSA ESTEBAN A	1012 PEACE ST	\$8,792.05	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
211	23-2232	HAZLETON CITY WARD 13	71-T8NW13-011-004-000	AGNELLO JOHN & BRIDGETT	836 N LEE CT	\$5,162.81	SOLD - \$29,000	145
212	23-2234	HAZLETON CITY WARD 13	71-T8NW24-012-007-000	OVIDEO ARGENTINA	772 SEYBERT ST	\$7,444.96	SOLD - \$51,000	226
213	23-2249	HAZLETON CITY WARD 14	71-T8NE44-015-02A-000	MORBAN SIMON ENRIQUE	540 REAR HARRISON ST	\$5,200.46	SOLD - \$33,000	69
214	23-2248	HAZLETON CITY WARD 14	71-T8NE44-015-005-000	NOVITSKY EDWARD F & ELEANOR M	530 HARRISON ST	\$9,715.05	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
215	23-2247	HAZLETON CITY WARD 14	71-T8NE44-015-004-000	NOVITSKY ELEANOR	532 HARRISON ST	\$8,433.82	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
216	23-2284	HAZLETON CITY WARD 15	71-U8NW42-004-010-000	ARIAS LAURY R MEDINA	146 BERNER AVE	\$3,263.65	SOLD - \$25,000	171
217	23-2285	HAZLETON CITY WARD 15	71-U8NW42-004-10B-000	ARIAS LAURY R MEDINA	144 BERNER AVE	\$3,014.74	SOLD - \$26,000	280
218	23-2286	HAZLETON CITY WARD 15	71-U8NW43-001-013-000	GALLAGHER GERTRUDE	498 S CEDAR ST	\$9,297.28	SOLD - \$48,000	308
219	23-2278	HAZLETON CITY WARD 15	71-U8NW34-002-008-000	LENGEN JOSEPH E JR	347 THIRWELL AVE	\$6,648.44	SOLD - \$38,000	69
220	23-0937	HUGHESTOWN BORO	28-E12NW1-004-025-000	KIZER DANIEL J & KAREN MARIE	14 ROCK ST	\$10,912.38	SOLD - \$16,000	69
221	23-0945	HUGHESTOWN BORO	28-E12NW4-008-018-000	MC DONNELL LOUISE M	181 ROCK DR	\$8,592.09	SOLD - \$54,000	69
222	23-0942	HUGHESTOWN BORO	28-E12NW1-008-039-000	MC HUGH GRACE + ELLEN	138 ROCK ST	\$13,501.86	SOLD - \$70,000	56
223	23-0943	HUGHESTOWN BORO	28-E12NW4-003-015-000	MCHUGH JOHN	190 ROCK ST	\$14,654.15	SOLD - \$54,000	69
224	23-0930	HUGHESTOWN BORO	28-D12SW4-009-003-000	OLIVER MARIE	305 PARSONAGE ST	\$9,809.64	SOLD - \$26,000	136
225	23-0947	HUGHESTOWN BORO	28-E12NW4-011-004-000	QUICK WAYNE D	CENTER ST	\$2,872.72	NO BID	
226	23-0960	HUNLOCK TWP	29-I4 -00A-17E-000	BOJONNY JAMES	142 OLD TAVERN DR	\$7,818.35	SOLD - \$7,818.35	69
227	23-0954	HUNLOCK TWP	29-H5 -00A-15C-000	CROOP STANLEY	ROARING BROOK DR	\$35,997.40	NO BID	
228	23-0955	HUNLOCK TWP	29-H5 -00A-15H-000	CROOP STANLEY	SWAMP RD	\$27,376.09	NO BID	
229	23-0984	HUNLOCK TWP	29-J651 -001-015-000	CROOP STANLEY	STATE ROUTE 11	\$4,767.88	NO BID	
230	23-0973	HUNLOCK TWP	29-J552 -004-05A-000	CROOP STANLEY C	SOBBERTOWN RD	\$3,299.88	NO BID	
231	23-0985	HUNLOCK TWP	29-J651 -002-007-000	GEORGE ORVAL JR	HUNLOCK GARDENS	\$9,376.68	NO BID	
232	23-0986	HUNLOCK TWP	29-J651 -002-04A-000	GEORGE ORVAL JR	GARDEN DR	\$5,212.07	NO BID	
233	23-0979	HUNLOCK TWP	29-J6 -00A-05A-000	GRAY GARY E	371 ROUTE 11	\$12,311.95	NO BID	
234	23-0969	HUNLOCK TWP	29-J5 -00A-22M-000	HARTMAN ROBERT C	1355 MAIN RD	\$9,612.25	SOLD - \$30,000	69
235	23-0966	HUNLOCK TWP	29-I6 -001-001-000	KOONS BERTHA EST	ADJ FRED CROOP	\$2,915.76	NO BID	
236	23-0971	HUNLOCK TWP	29-J5 -00A-28R-000	KRAMER DAVID & MARY E.	KOLB LN	\$5,965.75	NO BID	
237	23-0965	HUNLOCK TWP	29-I5 -00A-51M-000	STRICKLAND GLEN P	1755 MAIN RD	\$12,559.20	SOLD - \$12,559.20	69
238	23-0991	HUNTINGTON TWP	30-J151 -001-010-000	HOWELL JASON J	OLD TIOPA TPKE	\$5,858.35	NO BID	
239	23-0993	HUNTINGTON TWP	30-K2 -00A-077-000	HUDACK EDWARD J &	264 TOWN HILL RD	\$9,068.86	NO BID	
240	23-0989	HUNTINGTON TWP	30-J1 -00A-020-000	LOVETT STANLEY W & CATHERINE S	1367 OLD TIOPA TPKE	\$5,428.87	NO BID	
241	23-1007	HUNTINGTON TWP	30-M2 -00A-012-000	POLLICK ALFRED	WATERLON RD	\$3,948.90	SOLD - \$11,500	69
242	23-0994	HUNTINGTON TWP	30-K2 -00A-09B-000	SPAK JOHN P III	13 OLD KOONS RD	\$4,761.87	NO BID	
243	23-1000	HUNTINGTON TWP	30-K3 -00A-52B-000	SUTTON RICHARD & MICHELLE	HIGHBRIDGE RD	\$6,909.66	NO BID	
244	23-1019	JENKINS TWP	33-E1151 -003-014-000	BURKE JOHN	422 S MAIN ST	\$14,629.12	NO BID	
245	23-1038	JENKINS TWP	33-F1151 -06A-16A-000	DUDECK GERALD & ROSALIE	REAR MAIN ST	\$1,745.44	NO BID	
246	23-1036	JENKINS TWP	33-F1151 -005-021-000	HUGHES HENRY & CHARLOTTE	5 RUTLEDGE ST	\$10,236.63	SOLD - \$37,000	69
247	23-1044	JENKINS TWP	33-F1155A-003-007-000	STUCHKUS JOHN T	156 S HIGHLAND DR	\$131,214.84	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY	
248	23-1053	KINGSTON BORO WARD 1	34-G95E1 -013-007-000	DEMCHAK JOHN JR III	288 FREDERICK ST	\$17,014.64	SOLD - \$39,000	36
249	23-1054	KINGSTON BORO WARD 1	34-G95E1 -027-008-000	KACHMARSKY ANNA MARIE	258 RICHARD ST	\$18,719.16	SOLD - \$50,000	69
250	23-1089	KINGSTON BORO WARD 6	34-G95E3 -022-033-000	HULSE WILLIAM F	84 CHESTER ST	\$11,054.67	SOLD - \$69,000	36
251	23-1108	KINGSTON BORO WARD 7	34-H9NE1 -011-016-000	GREGORY ROXIE	46 S LOVELAND AVE	\$5,957.21	SOLD - \$38,000	36
252	23-1111	KINGSTON BORO WARD 7	34-H9NE4 -002-013-000	TRAN QUOC & KIMBERLY A	40 S THOMAS AVE	\$24,305.87	SOLD - \$71,000	103
253	23-1146	KINGSTON TWP	35-F954 -009-08A-000	GOBEL ELIZ C/O MRS THOMAS CONNORS	SHADY LN	\$11,777.38	NO BID	
254	23-1142	KINGSTON TWP	35-E957 -001-002-000	STAR BUILDERS CONTRACTORS INC	HARRIS HILL RD	\$1,930.88	NO BID	
255	23-1149	LAFLIN BORO	36-F1155 -004-004-000	PATELUNAS JEROME J II	MAIN ST	\$7,996.95	SOLD - \$7,996.95	139
256	23-1161	LAKE TWP	37-D653 -002-017-000	GREY THEODORA	LOYALVILLE OUTLET RD	\$5,411.55	SOLD - \$5,411.55	65
257	23-1169	LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 1	38-H851 -005-024-000	RUBIN KRISTY JO	40 MORGAN ST	\$7,180.48	SOLD - \$7,180.48	69
258	23-1193	LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 4	38-H855 -007-008-000	CHUPKA DOROTHY & ROBERT M	BUTTONWOOD LN	\$2,865.72	SOLD - \$7,000	240
259	23-1194	LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 4	38-H855 -007-009-000	CHUPKA DOROTHY & ROBERT M	244 BUTTONWOOD LN	\$11,366.06	SOLD - \$26,000	240
260	23-1202	LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 6	38-H854 -003-011-000	TEMPRINE HELEN ETAL	255 HOWARD ST	\$7,757.72	SOLD - \$34,000	69
261	23-1203	LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 6	38-H854 -003-11A-000	TEMPRINE LUKE HELEN & GEORGE	HOWARD ST	\$2,793.79	SOLD - \$2,793.79	69
262	23-1214	LARKSVILLE BORO WARD 7	38-G951 -013-13A-000	PFEIFER FAITHAN M	407 ORCHARD ST	\$8,466.32	SOLD - \$17,000	36
263	23-1265	LEHMAN TWP	40-G555 -06A-003-000	DEITZ JASON & BRIAN	126 SAYRE RD	\$13,206.37	SOLD - \$69,000	69
264	23-1258	LEHMAN TWP	40-G5 -T02-017-000	MORGAN CAROLINE	45 COUNTRY CREST LN	\$2,975.74	NO BID	
265	23-1266	LEHMAN TWP	40-G652 -004-04A-000	WAWRZYNSKI JOYCE T & LABUS STANLEY	MAPLE ST	\$5,159.97	NO BID	
266	23-1281	LUZERNE BORO WARD 4	41-F95E4 -022-007-000	EVANS CAROL	752 MILLER ST	\$16,478.45	SOLD - \$16,478.45	69
267	23-1291	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 1	42-J7NE4 -019-003-000	ARK OF SAFETY MINISTRIES	E MAIN ST	\$20,292.39	SOLD - \$20,292.39	69
268	23-1287	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 1	42-J7NE3 -002-20A-000	GUMBRAVICH RICHARD JR	10 DIVISION ST	\$7,872.17	SOLD - \$34,000	361
269	23-1288	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 1	42-J7NE4 -002-006-000	JONES ROBIN	9 LOOMIS ST	\$7,608.70	SOLD - \$25,000	69
270	23-1301	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 4	42-J7NW2 -002-011-000	KALINAY DONNA & TINA	HIGH & WILLOW STREET	\$1,755.68	NO BID	
271	23-1307	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 5	42-J7NE4 -028-007-000	KINSA USA LLC	333 STATE ST	\$8,724.88	SOLD - \$49,000	118
272	23-1318	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 6	42-J7SE1 -038-019-000	GLOWACKI THEODORE H	146 E RIDGE ST	\$9,883.07	SOLD - \$35,000	69
273	23-1316	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 6	42-J7SE1 -038-011-000	MINERSVILLE LLC	518 S WALNUT ST	\$6,546.23	SOLD - \$15,500	13
274	23-1323	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 8	42-K7S1 -013-16A-000	GORKA ANN F	ESPY ST	\$5,100.33	NO BID	
275	23-1350	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11	42-J7SW2 -009-27A-000	CASTRO NUNEZ AMERICA &	138 W UNION ST	\$5,853.99	SOLD - \$26,000	101
276	23-1367	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11	42-K7NW2 -02A-001-000	GORKA ANN	ENTERPRISE ST	\$6,524.08	SOLD - \$6,524.08	69
277	23-1357	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11	42-J7SW2 -014-035-000	GROUP ONE PROPERTIES LLC	148 W BROAD ST	\$3,028.34	NO BID	
278	23-1364	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 11	42-J7SW3 -002-004-000	MICHALOWSKI CARL	302 W UNION ST	\$10,191.71	SOLD - \$29,000	69
279	23-1375	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 12	42-J7SE4 -025-022-000	RONDON YAGER & CURETON CHARLOTTE	42 W FIELD ST	\$3,434.43	NO BID	

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
280	23-1370	NANTICOKE CITY WARD 12	42-J7SE4 -009-007-000	RULE RICHARD & HOLLY	33 ENTERPRISE ST	\$11,438.58	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY	
281	23-1400	NESCOPECK TWP	44-R3 -00A-023-000	BANKES DOUGLAS S	TOWER RD	\$4,353.68	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
282	23-1393	NESCOPECK TWP	44-Q3 -00A-018-000	MCGREEVY PATRICIA L	13 HAVENHILL LN	\$12,878.96	SOLD - \$12,878.96	245
283	23-1403	NEW COLUMBUS BORO	45-K1S1 -005-002-000	WOODWARD THOMAS	OLD TIOPA TPKE	\$2,702.35	NO BID	
284	23-1413	NEWPORT TWP WARD 1	46-K7S1 -001-006-000	GALLI ANN M	FRANKLIN ST	\$1,550.79	NO BID	
285	23-1408	NEWPORT TWP WARD 1	46-K6S3 -001-11A-000	KOKINDA DAVID	2 REAR COLLEGE HL	\$5,555.03	SOLD - \$5,555.03	139
286	23-1435	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -019-016-000	BLASI PETER F	46 NEWPORT ST	\$9,581.29	SOLD - \$9,581.29	69
287	23-1427	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -010-012-000	BRABANT RAYMOND J	101 NEWPORT ST	\$21,284.83	NO BID	
288	23-1428	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -010-013-000	BRABANT RAYMOND J	97 NEWPORT ST	\$4,698.72	NO BID	
289	23-1436	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -020-011-000	CJS SERVICES LLC	38 APPLE ST	\$6,616.73	SOLD - \$12,500	176
290	23-1422	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -007-013-000	DEGANTE OMAR	84 COAL ST	\$1,401.78	SOLD - \$1,401.78	319
291	23-1438	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -023-031-000	HUTCHINSON WILLIAM & SHERMA	13 RAILROAD ST	\$9,904.80	SOLD - \$9,904.80	69
292	23-1437	NEWPORT TWP WARD 2	46-K6S1 -022-007-000	SEIFERT EDWARD & RANDY	78 MAIN ST	\$7,277.41	SOLD - \$25,000	151
293	23-1464	NUANGOLA BORO	47-L8S4 -004-08A-000	EVANCHO MARK A	12 MEYERS ST	\$17,190.56	SOLD - \$17,190.56	69
294	23-2850	PENN LAKE PARK BORO	75-N12S2 -002-007-000	ANTHONY PAUL G JR	1550 LAKEVIEW DR	\$18,893.08	NO BID	
295	23-2299	PITTSTON CITY WARD 3	72-D11SE3-007-011-000	396 N MAIN LLC	396 N MAIN ST	\$17,052.89	NO BID	
296	23-2322	PITTSTON CITY WARD 6	72-E11NE3-002-008-000	RVFM 4 SERIES LLC	18 GEORGE ST	\$44,317.50	NO BID	
297	23-2328	PITTSTON CITY WARD 7	72-E11NE3-027-039-000	PLP PROMISE LAND PROPERTIES LLC	31 PROSPECT PL	\$4,999.80	BIDDER FORFEIT - OFF TO JUDICIAL	
298	23-2331	PITTSTON CITY WARD 8	72-E11SE2-023-004-000	ROWLANDS ANNMARIE	125 JOHN ST	\$15,673.79	SOLD - \$66,000	210
299	23-2334	PITTSTON CITY WARD 9	72-E11SE2-002-010-000	MANSOOR VIQAR SAYYED	50 MARKET ST	\$22,618.26	SOLD - \$36,000	210
300	23-2336	PITTSTON CITY WARD 10	72-E11SE1-009-002-000	HUNTER JEREMY	47 E COLUMBUS AVE	\$13,899.50	SOLD - \$40,000	242
301	23-2351	PITTSTON CITY WARD 11	72-E11SE1-018-010-000	HOLLMAN DANIEL ETAL	73 PLANK ST	\$15,181.78	SOLD - \$51,000	32
302	23-1677	PITTSTON TWP	51-D13S1 -001-31D-001	SLACK DOROTHY	32 DECKER LN	\$639.05	NO BID	
303	23-1602	PLAINS TWP WARD 1	50-F10S1 -001-019-000	EYET IRWIN	HARRIET ST	\$2,139.68	NO BID	
304	23-1603	PLAINS TWP WARD 1	50-F10S1 -001-020-000	EYET IRWIN	HARRIET ST	\$2,139.68	SOLD - \$2,139.68	79
305	23-1629	PLAINS TWP WARD 2	50-G10SW2-002-014-000	LECTISHON FRANCIS P	54 LAUREL ST	\$12,281.13	BIDDER FORFEIT - OFF TO JUDICIAL	
306	23-1630	PLAINS TWP WARD 2	50-G10SW2-009-005-000	Y&B REALTY ENTERPRISE LLC	61 WARNER ST	\$10,120.49	SOLD - \$37,000	69
307	23-1649	PLAINS TWP WARD 6	50-G10NE4-023-001-000	EYET IRWIN & ELIZ	MAIN ST	\$2,675.42	SOLD - \$2,675.42	258
308	23-1659	PLAINS TWP WARD 8	50-G11S4 -001-11A-000	FOX ALICIA	RIDGEWOOD RD	\$1,793.52	NO BID	
309	23-1660	PLAINS TWP WARD 8	50-G11S4 -002-006-000	FRANCIS LENORE F	RIDGEWOOD RD	\$8,028.09	NO BID	
310	23-1661	PLAINS TWP WARD 8	50-G11S4 -03A-12A-000	FRANCIS LENORE F	R RIDGEWOOD RD	\$6,550.15	NO BID	
311	23-1475	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 1	48-H8SE3 -006-004-000	OGIN JOSEPH EDWARD	335 PALMER ST	\$8,808.31	SOLD - \$26,000	69
312	23-1478	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 2	48-H8SE3 -011-005-000	SMITH PAUL R	221 BEADE ST	\$15,499.90	SOLD - \$27,000	69
313	23-1485	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 3	48-H8SE2 -002-018-000	ZUPANCIC LINDA SUSAN	CARVER ST	\$4,112.99	SOLD - \$4,112.99	69
314	23-1534	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 11	48-H8SE1 -006-001-000	OBRIEN TED L	276 GARDNER ST	\$9,773.59	SOLD - \$37,000	114
315	23-1549	PLYMOUTH BORO WARD 13	48-H8SW3 -014-002-000	KENNEDY HELEN	239 TEMPERANCE ST	\$3,995.47	NO BID	
316	23-1576	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I7S3 -004-026-000	BALUSKI HARRY J & ALICE A	REAR SUNRISE AVE	\$1,846.61	SOLD - \$1,846.61	33
317	23-1584	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I7S5 -002-007-000	BOGDAN VICTORIA	96 MCDONALD ST	\$8,242.86	SOLD - \$14,000	13
318	23-1600	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I8S1A -015-014-000	BUICKUS ANNE LANE	MORGAN AVE	\$1,462.92	NO BID	
319	23-1597	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I8S1A -000-VAR-000	DELEON WILFRED	PLYMOUTH TWP FLTS	\$967.53	NO BID	
320	23-1575	PLYMOUTH TWP	49-I7S3 -003-19A-000	HUDOCK BRANDIE & SHAWN	350 VALLEY VIEW AVE	\$5,181.58	NO BID	
321	23-1712	RICE TWP	53-L8S1 -001-007-000	GOSART CHARLES W & HELEN F	THOMAS RD	\$20,450.38	NO BID	
322	23-1720	RICE TWP	53-L9S4 -003-005-000	HERITAGE WOODS REAL ESTATE LLC	BURMA RD	\$8,282.31	NO BID	
323	23-1746	ROSS TWP	54-G4 -00A-44A-000	COOPER JOHN F	185 GRAY RD	\$6,894.03	SOLD - \$20,000	69
324	23-1733	ROSS TWP	54-F4 -00A-027-000	LAMOREAUX RUSSELL & MYRTLE ESTATE	HARRIS POND RD	\$26,540.81	NO BID	
325	23-1755	ROSS TWP	54-H3 -00A-052-000	PRESTO LORETTA &	137 BOOTH RD	\$4,904.88	SOLD - \$22,000	69
326	23-1749	ROSS TWP	54-G4S4 -001-05B-000	THUBBRON WILLIAM III	5258 REAR MAIN RD	\$1,812.42	NO BID	
327	23-1782	SALEM TWP	55-O3 -T02-067-000	CRANE ANGELA MARIE &	67 2ND LN	\$982.79	NO BID	
328	23-1783	SALEM TWP	55-O3 -T02-419-000	GROSS MARK	19 FOURTH LN	\$1,129.69	NO BID	
329	23-1772	SALEM TWP	55-M3S1 -003-018-000	HAMMOND PETER	HICKORY LN	\$5,077.14	NO BID	
330	23-1797	SALEM TWP	55-PANW2 -003-008-000	HORNER HAYES	53 MAIN ST	\$36,163.65	NO BID	
331	23-1803	SALEM TWP	55-P4S1 -005-010-000	KAJA HOLDINGS LLC	202 MAIN ST	\$18,156.46	NO BID	
332	23-1778	SALEM TWP	55-O3 -00A-004-000	KARNS TAMMY L	269 VARNERS HOLLOW RD	\$3,660.82	SOLD - \$3,660.82	229
333	23-1769	SALEM TWP	55-M3 -T04-007-000	KUKUVIKOV MANOLI	51 WHIPPER WILL LN	\$680.32	NO BID	
334	23-1800	SALEM TWP	55-P4S1 -002-013-000	MOWERY GORDON E & EVA M	1335 SALEM BLVD	\$10,629.81	SOLD - \$10,629.81	229
335	23-1794	SALEM TWP	55-P3SW1 -008-029-000	STOKER MELISSA A	504 E FOURTH ST	\$7,126.56	NO BID	
336	23-1765	SALEM TWP	55-M3 -T03-009-000	TUBBS JUNE	68 SLEEPY HOLLOW CT	\$1,208.51	NO BID	
337	23-1766	SALEM TWP	55-M3 -T03-010-000	TUBBS JUNE	10 SLEEPY HOLLOW CT	\$1,285.06	NO BID	
338	23-1767	SALEM TWP	55-M3 -T03-012-000	TUBBS JUNE	76 SLEEPY HOLLOW CT	\$1,183.86	NO BID	
339	23-1768	SALEM TWP	55-M3 -T03-023-000	TUBBS JUNE	47 SLEEPY HOLLOW CT	\$2,311.93	NO BID	
340	23-1760	SALEM TWP	55-L4S1 -002-004-000	YUDISKI JOYCE	CARSON ST	\$1,625.30	NO BID	
341	23-1805	SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 1	56-L4SE1 -019-001-000	MOYER COMMODORE ESTATE	17 SEARCH ST	\$2,018.46	NO BID	
342	23-1808	SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 3	56-L4SW2 -002-008-000	EISENHAEUER CRAIG	88 W BUTLER ST	\$3,312.06	NO BID	
343	23-1810	SHICKSHINNY BORO WARD 4	56-L4SE4 -001-001-000	KRZYWICKI FRANCIS & GERDA	69 GRANT ST	\$5,120.35	SOLD - \$5,120.35	69
344	23-1813	SLOCUM TWP	57-L7 -00A-044-000	DAVIES MARILYN ETAL	SLOCUM RD	\$2,602.93	NO BID	
345	23-1832	SUGARLOAF TWP	58-S5 -00A-006-001	GOOD CHARLES & MARY	23 MOLITORUS LN	\$1,038.02	SOLD - \$1,038.02	327
346	23-1823	SUGARLOAF TWP	58-R5 -00A-018-000	STICKLEY LISA	29 RED ROCK RD	\$7,099.65	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY	
347	23-1824	SUGARLOAF TWP	58-R5 -00A-01E-000	STICKLEY LISA	SANKO LN	\$589.96	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY	
348	23-1825	SUGARLOAF TWP	58-R5 -00A-01G-000	STICKLEY LISA	29 RED ROCK RD	\$17,174.15	REMOVED - BANKRUPTCY	
349	23-1892	UNION TWP	61-I4S1 -002-07A-000	AFFORDABLE HOUSING PARTNERS INC	101 HUNLOCK HARVEYVILLE RD	\$7,385.08	SOLD - \$7,385.08	120
350	23-1916	WEST HAZLETON WARD 1	63-T7SE2 -008-20A-000	MENCIA MELVIN B PERALTA	211 MAPLE ST	\$1,552.72	SOLD - \$1,552.72	25
351	23-1926	WEST HAZLETON WARD 2	63-T7NE3 -006-004-000	VICENTE ADRIA	522 ALLEN ST	\$9,614.97	SOLD - \$46,000	69
352	23-1985	WEST PITTSTON WARD 2	65-E11NE4-005-003-000	IRACE STEPHANIE	327 RACE ST	\$7,827.08	SOLD - \$45,000	136
353	23-1980	WEST PITTSTON WARD 2	65-E11NE1-012-017-000	LIW INVESTMENTS INC	504 WYOMING AVE	\$16,816.07	SOLD - \$22,000	247
354	23-2017	WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1	68-P12 -00A-01A-000	INVESTRAIC INC	BUFFALO ST	\$2,341.47	NO BID	
355	23-2020	WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1	68-P12NW1-016-002-000	PGA INCORPORATED	CHURCH ST	\$48,136.81	NO BID	
356	23-2018	WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 1	68-P12NW1-006-009-000	ROLDAN GEORGIA	215 WILKES BARRE ST	\$5,387.72	NO BID	
357	23-2028	WHITE HAVEN BORO WARD 2	68-P12 -00A-32A-000	SHROSKY JOSEPH JR + DOROTHY	OLD RTE 940	\$9,161.99	SOLD - \$28,000	245
358	23-2037	WILKES-BARRE TWP	69-I10NW3-007-029-000	GRAY EUGENE & ANTULOV JOSEPH	796 E NORTHAMPTON ST	\$11,315.78	SOLD - \$37,000	170
359	23-2034	WILKES-BARRE TWP	69-I10NW3-006-005-000	KRAHEL THOMAS & BARBARA	1031 SPRUCE ST	\$11,911.86	SOLD - \$50,000	118
360	23-2062	WILKES-BARRE TWP	69-I9SE2 -005-004-000	MARTIN ABEL EST	81 NICHOLSON ST	\$3,893.77	SOLD - \$25,000	28
361	23-2376	WILKES-BARRE WARD 1	73-H10NW4-017-011-000	RED HOUSE MANAGEMENT LLC	406 N MAIN ST	\$10,444.34	SOLD - \$32,000	121
362	23-2377	WILKES-BARRE WARD 1	73-H10NW4-017-012-000	RED HOUSE MANAGEMENT LLC	402 N MAIN ST	\$18,291.66	BIDDER FORFEIT - OFF TO JUDICIAL	
363	23-2409	WILKES-BARRE WARD 2	73-H10SW2-015-28A-000	DRAGON PETER III	54 PEARL ST	\$5,717.77	SOLD - \$5,717.77	121
364	23-2405	WILKES-BARRE WARD 2	73-H10SW2-011-031-000	MCGRAW MARGARET ANN	372 NEW GRANT	\$11,050.90	SOLD - \$51,000	101
365	23-2449	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-I10NW1-004-014-000	AGUILAR LARGO & MARY ELLEN SOSA	52 N EMPIRE ST	\$5,298.03	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
366	23-2440	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-H10SW4-009-060-000	GRIZ MANAGEMENT LLC	69 LOGAN ST	\$8,877.19	SOLD - \$16,500	101
367	23-2442	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-H10SW4-009-59A-000	GRIZ MANAGEMENT LLC	69 ADJ LOGAN ST	\$2,259.70	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
368	23-2452	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-I10NW1-005-024-000	JAMIOLKOWSKI BARBARA OSICK & JOHN J	69 WILKES LN	\$4,513.82	SOLD - \$17,000	69
369	23-2421	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-H10SW4-003-018-000	JODAY PROPERTIES LLC	5 N HANCOCK ST	\$29,460.39	SOLD - \$60,000	69
370	23-2439	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-H10SW4-009-004-000	JONES TRUMAN A & SIMONE S	7 N MEADE ST	\$12,519.79	SOLD - \$40,000	69
371	23-2451	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-I10NW1-004-031-000	OELLER ALFRED JR	448 NEW MARKET ST	\$4,902.74	SOLD - \$38,000	69
372	23-2438	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-H10SW4-008-036-000	OKAL JOHN	59 RENO LN	\$10,822.60	SOLD - \$37,000	136

	A	B	C	D	E	F	G	H
373	23-2447	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-H10SW4-019-044-000	PISHNICK CHARLES T & CATHERINE	45 N FULTON ST	\$11,104.48	SOLD - \$36,000	226
374	23-2450	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-110NW1-004-022-000	RATCHFORD MICHELLE M	28 N EMPIRE ST	\$6,854.62	SOLD - \$27,000	247
375	23-2448	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-H10SW4-019-045-000	TLATENCHI MOISES & MARIA R	41 N FULTON ST	\$7,763.53	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
376	23-2446	WILKES-BARRE WARD 3	73-H10SW4-019-043-000	TLATENCHI MOISES & MARIA ROSA	47 N FULTON ST	\$7,050.97	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
377	23-2487	WILKES-BARRE WARD 6	73-110NW1-013-034-000	CASTERLINE JAMES A & THERESA M	97 HILLSIDE ST	\$6,249.75	SOLD - \$45,000	69
378	23-2479	WILKES-BARRE WARD 6	73-110NW1-006-011-000	STAR BUILDER CONTRACTOR INC	S EMPIRE ST	\$2,275.73	SOLD - \$2,275.73	112
379	23-2480	WILKES-BARRE WARD 6	73-110NW1-006-012-000	STAR BUILDER CONTRACTOR INC	S EMPIRE ST	\$2,050.72	SOLD - \$2,050.72	112
380	23-2481	WILKES-BARRE WARD 6	73-110NW1-006-013-000	STAR BUILDER CONTRACTOR INC	S EMPIRE ST	\$2,050.72	NO BID	
381	23-2499	WILKES-BARRE WARD 9	73-110NW1-001-034-000	CASEY MARY S	129 S SHERMAN ST	\$12,006.04	SOLD - \$50,000	69
382	23-2510	WILKES-BARRE WARD 9	73-19NE2 -005-028-000	RED HOUSE MANAGEMENT LLC	286 E SOUTH ST	\$2,287.00	SOLD - \$2,287.00	458
383	23-2550	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -030-016-000	HOOKER DIANE	89 NEW ALEXANDER ST	\$1,975.17	BIDDER FORFEIT - OFF TO JUDICIAL	
384	23-2551	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -030-017-000	HOOKER DIANE	89 NEW ALEXANDER ST	\$10,744.40	SOLD - \$43,000	101
385	23-2553	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -031-025-000	PIMENTEL ALVARO AVILA	75-77 CAREY AVE AVE	\$3,048.38	NO BID	
386	23-2539	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SE4 -022-017-000	TESAR BRIAN	RR CAREY AVE	\$9,007.68	NO BID	
387	23-2564	WILKES-BARRE WARD 12	73-H9SW3 -008-010-000	VIDAL JUAN M	54 MARLBOROUGH AVE	\$3,291.73	NO BID	
388	23-2607	WILKES-BARRE WARD 13	73-19NE2 -048-026-000	MERCADO JUAN R	345 S HANCOCK ST	\$7,020.11	SOLD - \$33,000	69
389	23-2617	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-19NE1 -012-001-000	EDIFICE GROPU LLC	2-4 AIRY ST	\$40,330.56	SOLD - \$140,000	25
390	23-2643	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-19NE3 -023-008-000	EDIFICE GROPU LLC	392 HAZLE ST	\$20,963.24	SOLD - \$59,000	49
391	23-2644	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-19NE3 -023-027-000	GEORGE ANTHONY L & GEORGE A	210 JONES ST	\$2,919.69	SOLD - \$2,919.69	90
392	23-2674	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-19NE4 -037-029-000	HIRSCH MAYER	244 MCLEAN ST	\$18,055.33	SOLD - \$45,000	325
393	23-2618	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-19NE1 -012-017-000	LMD INVESTMENTS LLC	6 AIRY ST	\$6,262.61	SOLD - \$34,000	69
394	23-2650	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-19NE4 -003-001-000	PAHLER JOSEPH	354 HIGH ST	\$10,138.32	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
395	23-2656	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-19NE4 -011-030-000	SHRADER JANE EMMA FREY	66 SPRUCE ST	\$5,525.87	SOLD - \$30,000	196
396	23-2646	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-19NE3 -029-001-000	SMITH MICHAEL A & CAROL L	BLACKMAN ST	\$1,349.73	NO BID	
397	23-2619	WILKES-BARRE WARD 14	73-19NE1 -013-007-000	THOMAS CHARLES & ANNE MARIE	174 PARRISH ST	\$5,319.43	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
398	23-2714	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-19NW2 -012-006-000	777 LLP	HORTON ST	\$57,893.95	SOLD - \$57,893.95	120
399	23-2681	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-H9SE4 -017-010-000	BERISHA BEKIM ETAL	166 WOOD ST	\$18,265.84	SOLD - \$46,000	69
400	23-2684	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-H9SW3 -006-001-000	FORMOLA DEBRA & ROBERT	102 CRESCENT AVE	\$12,249.38	SOLD - \$72,000	69
401	23-2732	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-19NW2 -032-021-000	FOX DEBRA & DANIEL	142 CARLISLE ST	\$3,513.61	SOLD - \$33,000	458
402	23-2693	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-H9SW3 -044-023-000	MODERN HOME PROPERTY MANAGEMENT LLC	303 HORTON ST	\$10,635.63	SOLD - \$44,000	58
403	23-2708	WILKES-BARRE WARD 15	73-19NW2 -004-014-000	WINNICK MARCUS	13 HUSTON ST	\$2,413.68	SOLD - \$5,500	28
404	23-2747	WILKES-BARRE WARD 16	73-H10NW2-028-043-000	HERRERA ARSENIO E	470 MADISON ST	\$8,632.24	SOLD - \$25,000	136
405	23-2767	WILKES-BARRE WARD 16	73-H10NW4-007-04A-000	HRYZAN JASON PAUL	369 N PENNSYLVANIA AVE	\$6,868.70	SOLD - \$29,000	251
406	23-2783	WILKES-BARRE WARD 17	73-H10NE1-010-007-000	BOGAN IVAN	31 HARRIET ST	\$7,848.31	SOLD - \$7,848.31	69
407	23-2788	WILKES-BARRE WARD 18	73-G10SE4-007-002-000	KUKOWSKI RONALD M ETAL	75 AUSTIN AVE	\$10,936.49	REMOVED - TAXES PAID	
408	23-2808	WILKES-BARRE WARD 20	73-G10SE2-007-009-000	KEIPER OSCAR & ARVILLA	386 E MAIN ST	\$4,954.94	BIDDER FORFEIT - OFF TO JUDICIAL	
409	23-1959	WRIGHT TWP	64-N8S1 -003-016-000	KASHULA WILLIAM & ELIZABETH	S MAIN RD	\$1,817.30	SOLD - \$1,817.30	77
410	23-1958	WRIGHT TWP	64-N8S1 -003-015-000	KASHULA WILLIAM A & ELIZABETH A	S MAIN RD	\$1,817.30	SOLD - \$1,817.30	77
411	23-1952	WRIGHT TWP	64-M10 -00A-015-000	POLLOCK JOSEPH JR	CHURCH RD	\$5,559.50	NO BID	
412	23-2016	WYOMING BORO WARD 3	67-F10NE2-006-015-000	OCONNELL THELMA	MONOCANOCK AVE	\$3,362.16	NO BID	